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American Darling B-62-B 4.5" bury 5 1/4" valve w/5" Storz pumper
1 connection $ 2,631.00
American Darling B-62-B 4' bury 5 1/4" valve opening w/5"Storz pumper
2 connection $ 2,579.00
American Darling B-62-B 3.5' bury 5 1/4" valve Opening w5" Storz
3 pumper connection $ 2,527.00
Mueller Super Centurion Fire Hydant A-423 3.5' bury 5 1/4"valve opening
4 w/5" Storz pumper connection $ 2,528.94
Mueller Super Centurion Fire Hydant A-421 4' bury 5 1/4"valve opening
5 w/5" Storz pumper connection $ 2,485.10
Mueller Super Centurion Fire Hydant A-421 4.5' bury 5 1/4"valve opening
6 w/5" Storz pumper connection $ 2,525.27
7 American Darling Traffic repair kits $ 315.00
8 American Darling Hydrant Extensions 6" $ 539.00
9 American Darling Hydrant Extensions 12" $ 642.00
10 Mueller Super Centurion Hydrant Extension Kit A-319 0-6" $ 360.87
11 Mueller Super Centurion Hydrant Extension Kit A-319 1'-0" $ 419.87
12 Mueller Super Centurion Hydrant Extension Kit A-320 0-6" $ 396.90
13 Mueller Super Centurion Hydrant Extension Kit A-320 1'-0" $ 466.70
14 Mueller Super Centurion Safety Flange Repair Kit A-300 $ 174.04
15 Mueller Super Centurion Safety Flange Repair Kit A-301 $ 174.04
Sensus 5/8” x 3/4 ” Water Meter w/ECR Register w/readings in 1000
16 gallons $ 135.00
Sensus 5/8” x 3/4" Water Meter w/TRPL Register w/readings in 1000
17 gallons $ 150.00
18 Sensus 1” Water Meter w/ECR Register w/readings in 1000 gallons $ 228.00
19 Sensus 1” Water Meter w/TRPL Register w/readings in 1000 gallons $ 228.00
20 Sensus 1.5” Water Meter w/ECR Register w/readings in 1000 gallons $ 465.00
21 Sensus 1.5” Water Meter w/TRPL Register w/readings in 1000 gallons $ 465.00
22 Sensus 2” Water Meter w/ECR Register w/readings in 1000 gallons $ 650.00
23 Sensus 2” Water Meter w/TRPL Register w/readings in 1000 gallons $ 650.00
24 Complete Measuring Chambers $ 27.00
25 Bottom Plate gaskets $ 1.50
26 Bottom Plate Washers $ 1.50
27 Meter Bottoms $ 6.50
28 Screens $ 1.75
29 ECR Register w/reading in 1000 Gallons $ 62.00
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30 TRPL Register w/reading in 1000 Gallons $ 78.00
31 Complete Measuring Chambers $ 86.00
32 Bottom Plate gaskets $ 2.50
33 Bottom Plate Washers $ 2.80
34 Screens $ 2.30
35 Meter Bottoms $ 13.00
36 ECR Register w/reading in 1000 Gallons $ 71.00
37 TRPL Register w/reading in 1000 Gallons $ 76.00
38 Complete Measuring Chambers No bid received
39 Bottom Plate gaskets No bid received
40 Bottom Plate Washers No bid received
41 Screens No bid received
42 Meter Bottoms No bid received
43 ECR Register w/reading in 1000 Gallons No bid received
44 TRPL Register w/reading in 1000 Gallons No bid received
45 Complete Measuring Chambers No bid received
46 Bottom Plate gaskets No bid received
47 Bottom Plate Washers No bid received
48 Screens No bid received
49 Meter Bottoms No bid received
50 ECR Register w/reading in 1000 Gallons No bid received
51 TRPL Register w/reading in 1000 Gallons No bid received
52 Part #27 1/4" drive socket for registers $ 20.00
53 20" x 36" plastic cylinder $ 86.00
54 36" x 36" plastic cylinder $ 283.00
55 Ford Type A Single Lid Cover #A53-T $ 149.00
56 Monitor Covers Ford #MC-36-T $ 620.00
57 Ford 4" Elevator Ring #ER4AW $ 52.00
58 Ford 2 1/2" Elevator Ring #ER25AW $ 33.00
59 Ford Valve Handles #HB-345 $ 4.30
60 Ford Valve Handles #HH-67 $ 12.00
61 Coppersetters (curb hangers) for 5/8 meters No bid received
62 Coppersetters (curb hangers) for 5/8 meters No bid received
63 Coppersetters (curb hangers) for 5/8 meters No bid received
64 Coppersetters (curb hangers) for 1" meters No bid received
65 Coppersetters (curb hangers) for 1" meters No bid received
66 Coppersetters (curb hangers) for 1" meters No bid received
67 Center Hangers for 5/8' X 3/4" water meter Ford #CH11-233 $ 61.00
68 Center Hangers for 1" water meter Ford #CH11-444 $ 108.00
69 Kornerhorns for 5/8" x 3/4" water meters Ford KH-2 $ 48.00
70 Kornerhorns for 1" water meter Ford KH-4 $ 101.00
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71 Cutting Grease $ 15.25

FORD FB8004NL 1” corporation AWWA Tapered Thread with Increasing
72 Iron Pipe Outlet $ 52.00

FORD FB8006NL 1 1/2” corporation AWWA Tapered Thread with
73 Increasing Iron Pipe Outlet $ 115.00

FORD FB8007NL 2" corporation AWWA Tapered Thread with Increasing
74 Iron Pipe Outlet $ 196.00

FORD F10004QNL 1” corporation AWWA Tapered Thread with CTS
75 Compression outlet $ 44.00

FORD F10006WNL 1 1/2” corporation AWWA Tapered Thread with CTS
76 Compression outlet $ 125.00

FORD F10007QNL 2” corporation AWWA Tapered Thread with CTS
77 Compression outlet $ 207.00
78 1 CC Drill and Tap $ 243.47
79 1.5" CC Drill and Tap $ 592.94
30 2" CC Drill and Tap $ 832.46
81 B101 Tapping Machine $ 2,971.24
82 D5 Drilling Machine $ 1,751.36
83 E5 Drilling Machine $ 1,386.10
84 FORD B11333NL or equal 3/4" $ 45.00
85 FORD B11444NL or equal 1" $ 69.00
86 FORD B11666NL or equal 1 1/2" $ 142.00
87 FORD B00777NL or equal 2" $ 208.00
88 FORD B21333NL or equal 3/4" $ 50.00
89 FORD B21444NL or equal 1" $ 77.00
90 FORD B21666NL or equal 1 1/2" $ 169.00
91 FORD B21777NL or equal 2" $ 235.00
92 FORD B44333QNL or equal 3/4" $ 57.00
93 FORD B44444QNL or equal 1" $ 86.00
94 FORD B446600QNL or equal 1 1/2" $ 207.00
95 FORD B44777QNL or equal 2" $ 290.00
96 4" X 1" w/CC outlet $ 39.01
97 6" X 1" w/CC outlet $ 44.82
98 6" X 1.5" w/CC outlet $ 48.67
99 6" X 2" w/CC outlet $ 52.85
100 8" X 1" w/CC outlet $ 52.10
101 8" X 1.5" w/CC outlet $ 55.54
102 8" X 2" w/CC outlet $ 60.42
103 10" X 1" w/CC outlet $ 62.92
104 10" X 1.5" w/CC outlet $ 67.69
105 10" X 2" w/CC outlet $ 73.00
106 12" X 1" w/CC outlet $ 73.23
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107 12" X 1.5" w/CC outlet $ 78.43
108 12" X 2" w/CC outlet $ 83.91
109 4" X 1" w/CC outlet $ 39.01
110 6" X 1" w/CC outlet $ 44.82
111 6" X 1.5" w/CC outlet $ 48.67
112 6" X 2" w/CC outlet $ 53.71
113 8" X 1" w/CC outlet $ 52.94
114 8" X 1.5" w/CC outlet $ 57.29
115 8" X 2" w/CC outlet $ 62.51
116 10" X 1" w/CC outlet $ 62.92
117 10" X 1.5" w/CC outlet $ 67.69
118 10" X 2" w/CC outlet $ 73.00
119 12" X 1" w/CC outlet $ 73.23
120 12" X 1.5" w/CC outlet $ 78.43
121 12" X 2" w/CC outlet $ 83.91
122 FORD C84333QNL 3/4" $ 13.26

123 FORD C84444QNL 1" $ 15.70

124 FORD C84666QNL 1 1/2" $ 43.02

125 FORD C84777QNL 2" $ 62.65

126 FORD C1433QNL 3/4" $ 13.95

127 FORD C1444QNL 1" $ 18.90

128 FORD C1466QNL 1 1/2" $ 55.02

129 FORD C1477QNL 2" $ 65.50

130 Smith Blair #411 Dresser Couplings for .75” IP Cat#411-010501-003 $ 17.20
131 Smith Blair #411 Dresser Couplings for 1” IP Cat#411-013201-003 $ 17.80
132 Smith Blair #411 Dresser Couplings for 1.25” IP Cat#411-016601-003 $ 18.63
133 Smith Blair #411 Dresser Couplings for 1.5” IP Cat#411-019001-003 $ 22.26
134 Smith Blair #411 Dresser Couplings for 2” IP Cat#411-020001-003 $ 24.48
135 Insulating Adapter Gasket 1" IP x 1" CTS $ 10.00
136 Insulating Adapter Gasket 1 1/2" IP x 1" CTS $ 15.86
137 Insulating Adapter Gasket 2" IP x 2" CTS $ 17.87
138 HyMax Coupling 4" $ 150.84
139 HyMax Coupling 6" $ 199.75
140 HyMax Coupling 8" $ 225.53
141 HyMax Coupling 10" $ 312.90
142 Poly Tubing 200 psi rated 1" (price per foot) 0.37

143 Poly Tubing 200 psi rated 1 1/2" (price per foot) 0.83
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144 Poly Tubing 200 psi rated 2" (price per foot) $ 1.40

145 Buffalo Style Curb Box $ 62.00

146 Enlarged Base for Buffalo Style Curb Box $ 14.50

147 Repair Lid for Buffalo Style Curb Box $ 9.50

148 6" megalug retainer gland 1100 series compl w/gasket, nuts & bolts $ 32.73
149 8" megalug retainer gland 1100 series compl w/gasket, nuts & bolts $ 44.42
150 10" megalug retainer gland 1100 series compl w/gasket, nuts & bolts $ 63.46
151 12" megalug retainer gland 1100 series compl w/gasket, nuts & bolts $ 85.06
152 16" megalug retainer gland 1100 series compl w/gasket, nuts & bolts $ 145.34
153 Gate Valves Mueller resilient wedge open left 4" $ 482.78
154 Gate Valves Mueller resilient wedge open left 6" $ 615.78
155 Gate Valves Mueller resilient wedge open left 8" $ 980.74
156 Gate Valves Mueller resilient wedge open left 10" $ 1,529.16
157 Gate Valves Mueller resilient wedge open left 12" $ 1,915.20
158 Full Circle Repair Clamp Smith Blair #226-00048010-000 $ 60.34
159 Full Circle Repair Clamp Smith Blair #226-00048020-000 $ 118.46
160 Full Circle Repair Clamp Smith Blair #226-00048015-000 $ 88.21
161 Full Circle Repair Clamp Smith Blair #226-00048020-000 $ 118.46
162 Full Circle Repair Clamp Smith Blair #226-00048025-000 $ 148.73
163 Full Circle Repair Clamp Smith Blair #226-00048030-000 $ 182.46
164 Full Circle Repair Clamp Smith Blair #226-00071010-000 $ 72.21
165 Full Circle Repair Clamp Smith Blair #226-00071012-000 $ 85.61
166 Full Circle Repair Clamp Smith Blair #226-00071015-000 $ 99.15
167 Full Circle Repair Clamp Smith Blair #226-00071020-000 $ 144.41
168 Full Circle Repair Clamp Smith Blair #226-00071025-000 $ 174.68
169 Full Circle Repair Clamp Smith Blair #226-00071030-000 $ 208.40
170 Full Circle Repair Clamp Smith Blair #226-00117510-000 $ 106.87
171 Full Circle Repair Clamp Smith Blair #226-00117512-000 $ 126.45
172 Full Circle Repair Clamp Smith Blair #226-00117515-000 $ 158.74
173 Full Circle Repair Clamp Smith Blair #226-00117520-000 $ 210.47
174 Full Circle Repair Clamp Smith Blair #226-001175125-000 $ 243.09
175 Full Circle Repair Clamp Smith Blair #226-00117530-000 $ 314.06
176 Full Circle Repair Clamp Smith Blair #226-00132010-000 $ 115.01
177 Full Circle Repair Clamp Smith Blair #226-00132012-000 $ 139.17
178 Full Circle Repair Clamp Smith Blair #226-00132015-000 $ 172.94
179 Full Circle Repair Clamp Smith Blair #226-00132020-000 $ 228.43
180 Full Circle Repair Clamp Smith Blair #226-00132025-000 $ 266.76
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181 Full Circle Repair Clamp Smith Blair #226-00132030-000 $ 345.87
182 Full Circle Redi Clamps Smith Blair #224-010506-000 $ 31.48
183 Full Circle Redi Clamps Smith Blair #224-013206-000 $ 31.71
184 Full Circle Redi Clamps Smith Blair #224-019006-000 $ 32.72
185 Full Circle Redi Clamps Smith Blair #224-023806-000 $ 33.57
186 Redi-Clamp Smith Blair #248-010503-000 $ 14.89
187 Redi-Clamp Smith Blair #248-013203-000 $ 15.76
188 Redi-Clamp Smith Blair #248-019003-000 $ 16.59
189 Redi-Clamp Smith Blair #248-0238036-000 $ 18.08
190 Redi-Clamp Smith Blair #248-010503-000 $ 14.54
191 Redi-Clamp Smith Blair #248-010506-008 $ 26.08
192 Redi-Clamp Smith Blair #248-013203-000 $ 15.20
193 Redi-Clamp Smith Blair #248-013206-0008 $ 26.80
194 Quick Cam Repair Clamp TPS 4" Regular x9" QCRS-09-0510-001EX $ 17.16
195 Quick Cam Repair Clamp TPS 4" Regular x12" QCRS-12-0510-001EX $ 32.94
196 Quick Cam Repair Clamp TPS 4" Regular x15" QCRD-15-0510-001EX $ 21.30
197 Quick Cam Repair Clamp TPS 6" Regular x12" QCRS-12-0742-001EX $ 42.00
198 Quick Cam Repair Clamp TPS 6" Regular x15" QCRD-15-0742-001EX $ 98.05
199 Quick Cam Repair Clamp TPS 6" Regular x24" QCRS-24-0742-001EX $ 99.54
200 Quick Cam Repair Clamp TPS 8" Regular x12" QCRS-12-0944-001EX $ 121.79
201 Quick Cam Repair Clamp TPS 8" Regular x15" QCRD-15-0944-001EX $ 121.06
202 Quick Cam Repair Clamp TPS 8" Regular x24" QCRS-24-0944-001EX $ 138.77
203 Quick Cam Repair Clamp TPS 8" Regular x30" QCRS-30-0944-001EX $ 242.59
204 Quick Cam Repair Clamp TPS 8" Regular x30" QCRS-30-0944-001EX $ 131.12
205 Quick Cam Repair Clamp TPS 8" Regular x30" QCRS-30-0944-001EX $ 150.59
206 Quick Cam Repair Clamp TPS 8" Regular x30" QCRS-30-0944-001EX $ 249.11
207 Quick Cam Repair Clamp TPS 8" Regular x30" QCRS-30-0944-001EX $ 400.32
208 Wide Range Restraint - Restrained Coupling ALPHA-A-4.90 $ 212.32
209 Wide Range Restraint - Restrained Coupling ALPHA-A-7.00 $ 275.44
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210 Wide Range Restraint - Restrained Coupling ALPHA-A-9.10 $ 312.74
Quarter Bend Coupling Swivel Nut w/ Female Coupling Thread x MIP
211 Thread H-10023 1" $ 33.97
Quarter Bend Coupling Swivel Nut w/ Female Coupling Thread x MIP
212 Thread H-10023 1-1/2" No bid received
Quarter Bend Coupling Swivel Nut w/ Female Coupling Thread x MIP
213 Thread H-10023 2" No bid received
214 Full Circle Redi Clamps Smith Blair #226-00023807-000 $ 33.03
215 Full Circle Redi Clamps Smith Blair #226-00023810-000 $ 49.78
216 Full Circle Redi Clamps Smith Blair #226-023812-000 $ 58.64
217 Full Circle Redi Clamps Smith Blair #226-023815-000 $ 67.44




