
TENTATIVE AGENDA FOR COMMISSION MEETING
July 5, 2016, 6:30 P.M.

ROLL CALL- JULY 5, 2016

Reverend Jonathan Merki to deliver the invocation, followed by the salute to the flag.

Open Public Meetings Statement by Mayor Michael Santiago

“ This meeting is being conducted in accordance with the Open Public Meetings Act of 1975, was advertised, posted, and made available to the public as required by Statute.  The Municipal Clerk is directed to include a statement in the 
minutes of this meeting. ”

City Clerk to Review Changes To The Agenda

Minutes - Motion to approve and dispense with the reading of the June 21, 2016 Work Session Meeting Minutes, June 21, 2016 Closed Session Meeting Minutes and June 21, 2016 Commission Meeting Minutes and to proceed with the 
regular order of business. 

BILLS

PUBLIC COMMENT ON AGENDA ITEMS ONLY

OLD BUSINESS

Old Business Item (1)

Motion to receive and file the following reports from Regina Burke, QPA regarding proposals received by the Purchasing Board:

a) Proposals for a 2013 or Newer Sewer Jet and Catch Basin Cleaner received on April 27, 2016
b) Second Request for proposals for 2016 Health Services received on June 24, 2016
c) Proposals for Special Counsel for Collection Enforcement Services and Environmental Legal Counsel received  on June 23, 2016

Motion-
Second-

QPA REPORT-  SEWER JET.PDF , QPA REPORT-  2016 HEALTH SVCS.PDF, QPA REPORT-  COLLECTION ENFRCMNT AND ENVRNMNTL CNSLTNT.PDF

PETITIONS & LETTERS

Petitions & Letters Item (1)

Correspondence from FEMA re: Revalidated Letters of Map Change (LOMCs), which revise the effective National Flood Insurance Program (NFIP) map dated June 16, 2016

Motion-
Second-

FEMA LETTER.PDF

REPORTS OF COMMISSIONERS

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC AFFAIRS

DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE & FINANCE

Department Of Revenue And Finance (Item 1)

Commissioner's Report -  May 2016 

COMMISSIONER REPORTS -  CY16 MAY 2016 -  FINANCE.PDF

DEPARTMENT OF PARKS & PUBLIC PROPERTY

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

ORDINANCES 1ST READING

Ordinance 1st Reading Item (1) 

Bond Ordinance authorizing various capital improvements and acquisitions, appropriating one million dollars ($1,000,000.00) to pay the cost thereof, authorizing the issuance of nine hundred fifty thousand dollars ($950,000.00) of 

bonds to finance the appropriation and to provide for the issuance of bond anticipation notes in anticipation of the issuance of bonds
Motion-
Second- (Supplemental Debt Statement) 

SDS -  BOND ORD.PDF , BOND ORDINANCE.PDF

ORDINANCES 2ND READING

Ordinance 2nd Reading Item (1) 

An ordinance amending Chapter 5 Section 6D(6)(Inspections Under State Uniform Fire Code), Chapter 17, Section 16 (Enforcement of Regulations) and Section 19 (Reserved) and Chapter 33, Section 36E (Cumberland County 
Fairground-  State Uniform Fire Code Inspections)

Motion-
Second- (Public Hearing) 

PN ORD 2ND READING-  UFC.PDF , ORD AMNDNG CHPTR 5 SEC 6D 6 FIRE CODE .PDF

RESOLUTIONS

Resolution Item (1)

Resolution authorizing cancellation of mortgage executed by Gloria E. Eames covering property located at 302 S. 5th Street, Block 472, Lot 1 due to mortgage has been fully satisfied

Motion-
Second-

RES EAMES 070516.PDF, DISCHARGE OF MORTGAGE EAMES GLORIA.PDF

Resolution Item (2) 

Resolution authorizing the ratification award of an emergency contract for repair of the collapse in the main storm sewer collecting runoff at the intersection of 10th and F Street on May 20, 2016 to Garrison Enterprises, Inc., 211 
West Elmer Road, Vineland, NJ in the estimated amount of $11,000.00.

Motion-
Second- (Certification of Funds) 

CERT OF FUNDS-  GARRISON.PDF, RES EMERGENCY CONTRACT-  GARRISON ENT.PDF , EMERG PRCRMNTRPT -GARRISON ENT.PDF

Resolution Item (3) 

Resolution authorizing award of contract for purchase of a 2013 or Newer Jet Vac and Catch Basin Cleaner to Timmerman Co., Inc, 3554 Route 22 West, PO Box 71, Whitehouse, NJ  08888 in the amount of $299,000.00

Motion-
Second- (Certification of Funds) 

CERT OF FUNDS-  TIMMERMAN.PDF, RES - JET VAC TIMMERMAN.PDF

Resolution Item (4) 

Resolution authorizing Special Assessment of Municipal Liens for certain properties due to expenses incurred by the City of Millville relating to Board and Secure of Properties plus administration fees in accordance with Chapter 11, 
Article VI of the Municipal Code

Motion-
Second-

RES BOARD AND SECURE- 7- 5- 16.PDF

Resolution Item (5) 

Resolution authorizing a Memorandum of Agreement with TOWERCO 2013 LLC, a Delaware limited liability company to allow TOWERCO to perfect its rights to lease by recording it at the County Clerks office for the existing tower 
located at the Fire Department facility at 420 Buck Street

Motion-
Second-

RES TOWERCO 2013 LLC 6 27 16 (002).PDF , TOWERCO MOA.PDF

Resolution Item (6) 

Resolution authorizing Special Assessment of Municipal Liens for certain properties due to expenses incurred by the City of Millville relating to Cut and Clean plus administration fees in accordance with Chapter 11, Article VI of the 
Municipal code

Motion-
Second-

RES CUT AND CLEAN JULY 5 2016 MEETING.PDF

Resolution Item (7)

Resolution authorizing public auction of vehicles and equipment no longer needed for public use to be held on July 21, 2016 at 10:00 a.m., Police Impound Lot, Brandriff and Columbia Avenues

Motion-
Second-

RES PUBLIC AUCTION-  7- 21 - 16.PDF, PUBLIC AUCTION NOTICE -7 - 5- 16MTNG.PDF

Resolution Item (8)

Resolution authorizing adjustments to the tax and utility records
Motion-

Second-

RES TAX- UTILITY 2016- 07 - 05.PDF

Resolution Item (9) 

Resolution authorizing Second  Amendment to professional service contract approved by Resolution No. R257 -2015  on September 15, 2015 and First Amendment was approved by Resolution No. R115 -2016 on April 5, 
2016  with Todd J. Gelfand, Esquire of the firm of Barker, Gelfand and James, subsitute labor counsel for Gruccio, Pepper, DeSanto & Ruth, P.A., for an additional $5,000.00
Motion-

Second- (Certification of Funds) 

CET OF FUNDS GELFAND.PDF, RES BARKER, GELFAND AND JAMES, PC PSC.PDF, PSC BARKER GELFAND AND JAMES, PC (2).PDF

Resolution Item (10)

Resolution to approve the promotion of Steven Pierce to the position of Superintendent of Water Distribution, (provisional) Department of Public Works, with a starting salary of $76,000 effective July 1, 2016,  pursuant to Municipal 
Code 46- 12, subject to approval by the Civil Service Commission

Motion -
Second-

RES STEVEN PIERCE 7 -5 - 2016.PDF

Resolution Item (11)

Resolution authorizing Special Assessment of Municipal Liens for properties due to expenses incurred by the City of Millville relating to a demolition in accordance with Chapter 11 of the Municipal Code
Motion-

Second-

RES-  DEMO -  400 N 3RD ST.PDF

Resolution Item (12)

Resolution authorizing Water/Sewer Termination on July 18, 2016 due to payment default pursuant to Section 56 - 18 of the Municipal Code
Motion-
Second-

RES TURN OFF WATER AND SEWER 7 - 5- 16.PDF

Resolution Item (13) 

Resolution authorizing Agreement between the Millville Housing Authority and the City of Millville for enhanced police services at Holly Berry Court and the adjacent areas

Motion-
Second-

RES HOLLY BERRY COURT 6 15 16.PDF, AGREEMENT POLICE SERVICES HOLLY BERRY COURT 6 15 16.PDF

Resolution Item (14) 

Resolution authorizing First Amendment to Professional Service Contract adopted by Resolution No. R30 - 2016 on January 19, 2016 with Robert Verry, Hearing Officer for administrative proceedings involving disciplinary and grievance 
matters within the Millville Police Department for an additional $12,500.00.

Motion-
Second- (Certification of Funds) 

CERT OF FUNDS-  VERRY.PDF , RES ROBERT A VERRY 1ST AMENDED PSC 6 22 16.PDF , PSC ROBERT A VERRY 1ST AMENDED 6 22 16 (002).PDF

Resolution Item (15)

Resolution authorizing Second Amendment to Professional Service Contract  adopted by Resolution No. R16- 2016 on January 5, 2016 with Maley & Associates, Counsellors at Law, 931 Haddon Avenue, Collingswood, New Jersey 
08108- 2111, Special Counsel for Redevelopment for an additional $10,000.00.

Motion-
Second- (Certification of Funds) 

CERT OF FUNDS-  MALEY.PDF , RES PSC MALEY ASSOCS 6 22 16 .PDF , PSC 2ND AMENDED MALEY ASSOCS 6 22 16.PDF

Resolution Item (16) 

Resolution adopting a form required to be used for the filing of notices of Tort Claim against the City of Millville in accordance with the provisions of the New Jersey Tort Claims Act, N.J.S.A. 59:8- 6.

Motion-
Second-

RES ADOPT TORT FORM.PDF

Resolution Item (17) 

Resolution authorizing the City of Millville to execute a Subordination Agreement with Quicken Loans pertaining to 559 Columbia Avenue, Block 553, Lot 19, William Phillips
Motion-

Second-

RES -  559 COLUMBIA -  PHILLIPS SUBORDINATION 7 - 5- 16.PDF

Resolution Item (18) 

Resolution to approve Stipulation of Dismissal with prejudice as to Counts 2 through 5 re: City of Millville vs Richard Abbott, William Whitehead, Judith Whitehead, John Doe 1- 10, abc corp 1 - 10
Motion-
Second-

RES -  BOAT DOCKS-  ABBOTT.PDF , STIPULATION OF DISMISSAL - WHITEHEAD - ABBOTT DOCKS.PDF

Resolution Item (19) 

Resolution to approve the release of closed session minutes re: City of Millville vs Richard Abbott, William Whitehead, Judith Whitehead, John Doe 1- 10, abc corp 1 -10

Motion-
Second-

RES - OPEN CLOSED SESSION MINUTES - DOCKS.PDF, EXHIBIT A - CLOSED SESSION RELEASE SCHEDULE.PDF

Resolution Item (20)

Resolution to approve the promotion of Frank Hignutt to the position of Sewage Plant Superintendent/Sewer Superintendent (Provisional), Department of Public Works, with a starting salary of $84,622.82 effective July 1, 2016, 
 pursuant to Municipal Code 46- 12, subject to approval by the Civil Service Commission

Motion-
Second-

RES FRANK HIGNUTT 7 - 5- 2016.PDF

NEW BUSINESS

New Business Item (1)

Motion authorizing the City Clerk/Administrator to advertise for the following bid proposals to be received on the specified date and time by the City of Millville Purchasing Board, Richard C. McCarthy Commission Chamber, City Hall:
a) 15th Street Fencing and Gates to be received on June 28, 2016, 10:00 A.M.
b) Lease of Space for Temporary Cellular Antenna System to be received on June 28, 2016, 10:00 A.M.
c ) Wastewater Treatment Plant Phase II Upgrades Project to be received on August 23, 2016, 10:00 A.M.

Motion-
Second-

PN-  15TH STREET FENCING AND GATES.PDF , PN LEASE SPACE FOR CELLULAR ANTENNAS 2016.PDF, PN WWTP.PDF

New Business Item (2)

Motion authorizing the following Special Event on Public Lands Applications:

a) 5k Run/1 Mile Walk sponsored by the Millville PBA Local No. 213 to be held on Saturday, July 16, 2016, 8:00 a.m. to 1:00 p.m., Chiola Field, (Ware Avenue, W. Main Street and Brandriff Avenue)
b) Community Event with Child Activities sponsored by Gateway Community Action Partnership to be held on August 6, 2016, 12:30 p.m. to 5:30 p.m. at Waltman Park

c ) Downtown Car Show Annual Event sponsored by Greater Millville Chamber of Commerce to be held on August 13, 2016 (Rain Date: August 20, 2016), 6:30 a.m. to 4:00 p.m. on High Street from Main Street to Broad Street
Motion-

Second-

PUBLIC COMMENT PORTION

"We have now reached the public comment portion of our meeting.  Anyone who would like to address the Commission, please go to the podium, state your name and address your concerns.  Please limit your comments to 
approximately 5 minutes."

Open Public Portion

Close Public Portion

Comments by Commissioners

Adjourn 

1.

2.

3.

4.

4.I.

Documents:

5.

5.I.

Documents:

6.

7.

8.

9.

9.I.

Documents:

10.

11.

12.

12.I.

Documents:

13.

13.I.

Documents:

14.

14.I.

Documents:

14.II.

Documents:

14.III.

Documents:

14.IV.

Documents:

14.V.

Documents:

14.VI.

Documents:

14.VII.

Documents:

14.VIII.

Documents:

14.IX.

Documents:

14.X.

Documents:

14.XI.

Documents:

14.XII.

Documents:

14.XIII.

Documents:

14.XIV.

Documents:

14.XV.

Documents:

14.XVI.

Documents:

14.XVII.

Documents:

14.XVIII.

Documents:

14.XIX.

Documents:

14.XX.

Documents:

15.

15.I.

Documents:

15.II.

16.

http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4100?fileID=8905
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4100?fileID=8906
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4100?fileID=8907
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4102?fileID=8908
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4122?fileID=8923
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4110?fileID=8909
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4110?fileID=8910
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4112?fileID=8911
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4112?fileID=8912
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4114?fileID=8913
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4114?fileID=8914
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4036?fileID=8855
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4036?fileID=8926
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4036?fileID=8894
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4037?fileID=8856
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4037?fileID=8857
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4038?fileID=8858
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4039?fileID=8859
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4039?fileID=8860
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4040?fileID=8861


TENTATIVE AGENDA FOR COMMISSION MEETING
July 5, 2016, 6:30 P.M.

ROLL CALL- JULY 5, 2016

Reverend Jonathan Merki to deliver the invocation, followed by the salute to the flag.

Open Public Meetings Statement by Mayor Michael Santiago

“ This meeting is being conducted in accordance with the Open Public Meetings Act of 1975, was advertised, posted, and made available to the public as required by Statute.  The Municipal Clerk is directed to include a statement in the 
minutes of this meeting. ”

City Clerk to Review Changes To The Agenda

Minutes - Motion to approve and dispense with the reading of the June 21, 2016 Work Session Meeting Minutes, June 21, 2016 Closed Session Meeting Minutes and June 21, 2016 Commission Meeting Minutes and to proceed with the 
regular order of business. 

BILLS

PUBLIC COMMENT ON AGENDA ITEMS ONLY

OLD BUSINESS

Old Business Item (1)

Motion to receive and file the following reports from Regina Burke, QPA regarding proposals received by the Purchasing Board:

a) Proposals for a 2013 or Newer Sewer Jet and Catch Basin Cleaner received on April 27, 2016
b) Second Request for proposals for 2016 Health Services received on June 24, 2016
c) Proposals for Special Counsel for Collection Enforcement Services and Environmental Legal Counsel received  on June 23, 2016

Motion-
Second-

QPA REPORT-  SEWER JET.PDF , QPA REPORT-  2016 HEALTH SVCS.PDF, QPA REPORT-  COLLECTION ENFRCMNT AND ENVRNMNTL CNSLTNT.PDF

PETITIONS & LETTERS

Petitions & Letters Item (1)

Correspondence from FEMA re: Revalidated Letters of Map Change (LOMCs), which revise the effective National Flood Insurance Program (NFIP) map dated June 16, 2016

Motion-
Second-

FEMA LETTER.PDF

REPORTS OF COMMISSIONERS

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC AFFAIRS

DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE & FINANCE

Department Of Revenue And Finance (Item 1)

Commissioner's Report -  May 2016 

COMMISSIONER REPORTS -  CY16 MAY 2016 -  FINANCE.PDF

DEPARTMENT OF PARKS & PUBLIC PROPERTY

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

ORDINANCES 1ST READING

Ordinance 1st Reading Item (1) 

Bond Ordinance authorizing various capital improvements and acquisitions, appropriating one million dollars ($1,000,000.00) to pay the cost thereof, authorizing the issuance of nine hundred fifty thousand dollars ($950,000.00) of 

bonds to finance the appropriation and to provide for the issuance of bond anticipation notes in anticipation of the issuance of bonds
Motion-
Second- (Supplemental Debt Statement) 

SDS -  BOND ORD.PDF , BOND ORDINANCE.PDF

ORDINANCES 2ND READING

Ordinance 2nd Reading Item (1) 

An ordinance amending Chapter 5 Section 6D(6)(Inspections Under State Uniform Fire Code), Chapter 17, Section 16 (Enforcement of Regulations) and Section 19 (Reserved) and Chapter 33, Section 36E (Cumberland County 
Fairground-  State Uniform Fire Code Inspections)

Motion-
Second- (Public Hearing) 

PN ORD 2ND READING-  UFC.PDF , ORD AMNDNG CHPTR 5 SEC 6D 6 FIRE CODE .PDF

RESOLUTIONS

Resolution Item (1)

Resolution authorizing cancellation of mortgage executed by Gloria E. Eames covering property located at 302 S. 5th Street, Block 472, Lot 1 due to mortgage has been fully satisfied

Motion-
Second-

RES EAMES 070516.PDF, DISCHARGE OF MORTGAGE EAMES GLORIA.PDF

Resolution Item (2) 

Resolution authorizing the ratification award of an emergency contract for repair of the collapse in the main storm sewer collecting runoff at the intersection of 10th and F Street on May 20, 2016 to Garrison Enterprises, Inc., 211 
West Elmer Road, Vineland, NJ in the estimated amount of $11,000.00.

Motion-
Second- (Certification of Funds) 

CERT OF FUNDS-  GARRISON.PDF, RES EMERGENCY CONTRACT-  GARRISON ENT.PDF , EMERG PRCRMNTRPT -GARRISON ENT.PDF

Resolution Item (3) 

Resolution authorizing award of contract for purchase of a 2013 or Newer Jet Vac and Catch Basin Cleaner to Timmerman Co., Inc, 3554 Route 22 West, PO Box 71, Whitehouse, NJ  08888 in the amount of $299,000.00

Motion-
Second- (Certification of Funds) 

CERT OF FUNDS-  TIMMERMAN.PDF, RES - JET VAC TIMMERMAN.PDF

Resolution Item (4) 

Resolution authorizing Special Assessment of Municipal Liens for certain properties due to expenses incurred by the City of Millville relating to Board and Secure of Properties plus administration fees in accordance with Chapter 11, 
Article VI of the Municipal Code

Motion-
Second-

RES BOARD AND SECURE- 7- 5- 16.PDF

Resolution Item (5) 

Resolution authorizing a Memorandum of Agreement with TOWERCO 2013 LLC, a Delaware limited liability company to allow TOWERCO to perfect its rights to lease by recording it at the County Clerks office for the existing tower 
located at the Fire Department facility at 420 Buck Street

Motion-
Second-

RES TOWERCO 2013 LLC 6 27 16 (002).PDF , TOWERCO MOA.PDF

Resolution Item (6) 

Resolution authorizing Special Assessment of Municipal Liens for certain properties due to expenses incurred by the City of Millville relating to Cut and Clean plus administration fees in accordance with Chapter 11, Article VI of the 
Municipal code

Motion-
Second-

RES CUT AND CLEAN JULY 5 2016 MEETING.PDF

Resolution Item (7)

Resolution authorizing public auction of vehicles and equipment no longer needed for public use to be held on July 21, 2016 at 10:00 a.m., Police Impound Lot, Brandriff and Columbia Avenues

Motion-
Second-

RES PUBLIC AUCTION-  7- 21 - 16.PDF, PUBLIC AUCTION NOTICE -7 - 5- 16MTNG.PDF

Resolution Item (8)

Resolution authorizing adjustments to the tax and utility records
Motion-

Second-

RES TAX- UTILITY 2016- 07 - 05.PDF

Resolution Item (9) 

Resolution authorizing Second  Amendment to professional service contract approved by Resolution No. R257 -2015  on September 15, 2015 and First Amendment was approved by Resolution No. R115 -2016 on April 5, 
2016  with Todd J. Gelfand, Esquire of the firm of Barker, Gelfand and James, subsitute labor counsel for Gruccio, Pepper, DeSanto & Ruth, P.A., for an additional $5,000.00
Motion-

Second- (Certification of Funds) 

CET OF FUNDS GELFAND.PDF, RES BARKER, GELFAND AND JAMES, PC PSC.PDF, PSC BARKER GELFAND AND JAMES, PC (2).PDF

Resolution Item (10)

Resolution to approve the promotion of Steven Pierce to the position of Superintendent of Water Distribution, (provisional) Department of Public Works, with a starting salary of $76,000 effective July 1, 2016,  pursuant to Municipal 
Code 46- 12, subject to approval by the Civil Service Commission

Motion -
Second-

RES STEVEN PIERCE 7 -5 - 2016.PDF

Resolution Item (11)

Resolution authorizing Special Assessment of Municipal Liens for properties due to expenses incurred by the City of Millville relating to a demolition in accordance with Chapter 11 of the Municipal Code
Motion-

Second-

RES-  DEMO -  400 N 3RD ST.PDF

Resolution Item (12)

Resolution authorizing Water/Sewer Termination on July 18, 2016 due to payment default pursuant to Section 56 - 18 of the Municipal Code
Motion-
Second-

RES TURN OFF WATER AND SEWER 7 - 5- 16.PDF

Resolution Item (13) 

Resolution authorizing Agreement between the Millville Housing Authority and the City of Millville for enhanced police services at Holly Berry Court and the adjacent areas

Motion-
Second-

RES HOLLY BERRY COURT 6 15 16.PDF, AGREEMENT POLICE SERVICES HOLLY BERRY COURT 6 15 16.PDF

Resolution Item (14) 

Resolution authorizing First Amendment to Professional Service Contract adopted by Resolution No. R30 - 2016 on January 19, 2016 with Robert Verry, Hearing Officer for administrative proceedings involving disciplinary and grievance 
matters within the Millville Police Department for an additional $12,500.00.

Motion-
Second- (Certification of Funds) 

CERT OF FUNDS-  VERRY.PDF , RES ROBERT A VERRY 1ST AMENDED PSC 6 22 16.PDF , PSC ROBERT A VERRY 1ST AMENDED 6 22 16 (002).PDF

Resolution Item (15)

Resolution authorizing Second Amendment to Professional Service Contract  adopted by Resolution No. R16- 2016 on January 5, 2016 with Maley & Associates, Counsellors at Law, 931 Haddon Avenue, Collingswood, New Jersey 
08108- 2111, Special Counsel for Redevelopment for an additional $10,000.00.

Motion-
Second- (Certification of Funds) 

CERT OF FUNDS-  MALEY.PDF , RES PSC MALEY ASSOCS 6 22 16 .PDF , PSC 2ND AMENDED MALEY ASSOCS 6 22 16.PDF

Resolution Item (16) 

Resolution adopting a form required to be used for the filing of notices of Tort Claim against the City of Millville in accordance with the provisions of the New Jersey Tort Claims Act, N.J.S.A. 59:8- 6.

Motion-
Second-

RES ADOPT TORT FORM.PDF

Resolution Item (17) 

Resolution authorizing the City of Millville to execute a Subordination Agreement with Quicken Loans pertaining to 559 Columbia Avenue, Block 553, Lot 19, William Phillips
Motion-

Second-

RES -  559 COLUMBIA -  PHILLIPS SUBORDINATION 7 - 5- 16.PDF

Resolution Item (18) 

Resolution to approve Stipulation of Dismissal with prejudice as to Counts 2 through 5 re: City of Millville vs Richard Abbott, William Whitehead, Judith Whitehead, John Doe 1- 10, abc corp 1 - 10
Motion-
Second-

RES -  BOAT DOCKS-  ABBOTT.PDF , STIPULATION OF DISMISSAL - WHITEHEAD - ABBOTT DOCKS.PDF

Resolution Item (19) 

Resolution to approve the release of closed session minutes re: City of Millville vs Richard Abbott, William Whitehead, Judith Whitehead, John Doe 1- 10, abc corp 1 -10

Motion-
Second-

RES - OPEN CLOSED SESSION MINUTES - DOCKS.PDF, EXHIBIT A - CLOSED SESSION RELEASE SCHEDULE.PDF

Resolution Item (20)

Resolution to approve the promotion of Frank Hignutt to the position of Sewage Plant Superintendent/Sewer Superintendent (Provisional), Department of Public Works, with a starting salary of $84,622.82 effective July 1, 2016, 
 pursuant to Municipal Code 46- 12, subject to approval by the Civil Service Commission

Motion-
Second-

RES FRANK HIGNUTT 7 - 5- 2016.PDF

NEW BUSINESS

New Business Item (1)

Motion authorizing the City Clerk/Administrator to advertise for the following bid proposals to be received on the specified date and time by the City of Millville Purchasing Board, Richard C. McCarthy Commission Chamber, City Hall:
a) 15th Street Fencing and Gates to be received on June 28, 2016, 10:00 A.M.
b) Lease of Space for Temporary Cellular Antenna System to be received on June 28, 2016, 10:00 A.M.
c ) Wastewater Treatment Plant Phase II Upgrades Project to be received on August 23, 2016, 10:00 A.M.

Motion-
Second-

PN-  15TH STREET FENCING AND GATES.PDF , PN LEASE SPACE FOR CELLULAR ANTENNAS 2016.PDF, PN WWTP.PDF

New Business Item (2)

Motion authorizing the following Special Event on Public Lands Applications:

a) 5k Run/1 Mile Walk sponsored by the Millville PBA Local No. 213 to be held on Saturday, July 16, 2016, 8:00 a.m. to 1:00 p.m., Chiola Field, (Ware Avenue, W. Main Street and Brandriff Avenue)
b) Community Event with Child Activities sponsored by Gateway Community Action Partnership to be held on August 6, 2016, 12:30 p.m. to 5:30 p.m. at Waltman Park

c ) Downtown Car Show Annual Event sponsored by Greater Millville Chamber of Commerce to be held on August 13, 2016 (Rain Date: August 20, 2016), 6:30 a.m. to 4:00 p.m. on High Street from Main Street to Broad Street
Motion-

Second-

PUBLIC COMMENT PORTION

"We have now reached the public comment portion of our meeting.  Anyone who would like to address the Commission, please go to the podium, state your name and address your concerns.  Please limit your comments to 
approximately 5 minutes."

Open Public Portion

Close Public Portion

Comments by Commissioners

Adjourn 

1.

2.

3.

4.

4.I.

Documents:

5.

5.I.

Documents:

6.

7.

8.

9.

9.I.

Documents:

10.

11.

12.

12.I.

Documents:

13.

13.I.

Documents:

14.

14.I.

Documents:

14.II.

Documents:

14.III.

Documents:

14.IV.

Documents:

14.V.

Documents:

14.VI.

Documents:

14.VII.

Documents:

14.VIII.

Documents:

14.IX.

Documents:

14.X.

Documents:

14.XI.

Documents:

14.XII.

Documents:

14.XIII.

Documents:

14.XIV.

Documents:

14.XV.

Documents:

14.XVI.

Documents:

14.XVII.

Documents:

14.XVIII.

Documents:

14.XIX.

Documents:

14.XX.

Documents:

15.

15.I.

Documents:

15.II.

16.

http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4041?fileID=8863
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4041?fileID=8862
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4047?fileID=8865
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4119?fileID=8919
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4119?fileID=8941
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4119?fileID=8940
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4050?fileID=8869
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4051?fileID=8870
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4052?fileID=8871
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4053?fileID=8882
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4053?fileID=8881
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4054?fileID=8883
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4054?fileID=8873
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4054?fileID=8872
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4055?fileID=8884
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4055?fileID=8875
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4055?fileID=8874
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4056?fileID=8876
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4059?fileID=8878
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4078?fileID=8898
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4078?fileID=8899
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4080?fileID=8902
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4080?fileID=8901
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4120?fileID=8921
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4033?fileID=8846
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4033?fileID=8849
http://www.millvillenj.gov/AgendaCenter/ViewFile/Item/4033?fileID=8920


TENTATIVE AGENDA FOR COMMISSION MEETING
July 5, 2016, 6:30 P.M.

ROLL CALL- JULY 5, 2016

Reverend Jonathan Merki to deliver the invocation, followed by the salute to the flag.

Open Public Meetings Statement by Mayor Michael Santiago

“ This meeting is being conducted in accordance with the Open Public Meetings Act of 1975, was advertised, posted, and made available to the public as required by Statute.  The Municipal Clerk is directed to include a statement in the 
minutes of this meeting. ”

City Clerk to Review Changes To The Agenda

Minutes - Motion to approve and dispense with the reading of the June 21, 2016 Work Session Meeting Minutes, June 21, 2016 Closed Session Meeting Minutes and June 21, 2016 Commission Meeting Minutes and to proceed with the 
regular order of business. 

BILLS

PUBLIC COMMENT ON AGENDA ITEMS ONLY

OLD BUSINESS

Old Business Item (1)

Motion to receive and file the following reports from Regina Burke, QPA regarding proposals received by the Purchasing Board:

a) Proposals for a 2013 or Newer Sewer Jet and Catch Basin Cleaner received on April 27, 2016
b) Second Request for proposals for 2016 Health Services received on June 24, 2016
c) Proposals for Special Counsel for Collection Enforcement Services and Environmental Legal Counsel received  on June 23, 2016

Motion-
Second-

QPA REPORT-  SEWER JET.PDF , QPA REPORT-  2016 HEALTH SVCS.PDF, QPA REPORT-  COLLECTION ENFRCMNT AND ENVRNMNTL CNSLTNT.PDF

PETITIONS & LETTERS

Petitions & Letters Item (1)

Correspondence from FEMA re: Revalidated Letters of Map Change (LOMCs), which revise the effective National Flood Insurance Program (NFIP) map dated June 16, 2016

Motion-
Second-

FEMA LETTER.PDF

REPORTS OF COMMISSIONERS

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC AFFAIRS

DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE & FINANCE

Department Of Revenue And Finance (Item 1)

Commissioner's Report -  May 2016 

COMMISSIONER REPORTS -  CY16 MAY 2016 -  FINANCE.PDF

DEPARTMENT OF PARKS & PUBLIC PROPERTY

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

ORDINANCES 1ST READING

Ordinance 1st Reading Item (1) 

Bond Ordinance authorizing various capital improvements and acquisitions, appropriating one million dollars ($1,000,000.00) to pay the cost thereof, authorizing the issuance of nine hundred fifty thousand dollars ($950,000.00) of 

bonds to finance the appropriation and to provide for the issuance of bond anticipation notes in anticipation of the issuance of bonds
Motion-
Second- (Supplemental Debt Statement) 

SDS -  BOND ORD.PDF , BOND ORDINANCE.PDF

ORDINANCES 2ND READING

Ordinance 2nd Reading Item (1) 

An ordinance amending Chapter 5 Section 6D(6)(Inspections Under State Uniform Fire Code), Chapter 17, Section 16 (Enforcement of Regulations) and Section 19 (Reserved) and Chapter 33, Section 36E (Cumberland County 
Fairground-  State Uniform Fire Code Inspections)

Motion-
Second- (Public Hearing) 

PN ORD 2ND READING-  UFC.PDF , ORD AMNDNG CHPTR 5 SEC 6D 6 FIRE CODE .PDF

RESOLUTIONS

Resolution Item (1)

Resolution authorizing cancellation of mortgage executed by Gloria E. Eames covering property located at 302 S. 5th Street, Block 472, Lot 1 due to mortgage has been fully satisfied

Motion-
Second-

RES EAMES 070516.PDF, DISCHARGE OF MORTGAGE EAMES GLORIA.PDF

Resolution Item (2) 

Resolution authorizing the ratification award of an emergency contract for repair of the collapse in the main storm sewer collecting runoff at the intersection of 10th and F Street on May 20, 2016 to Garrison Enterprises, Inc., 211 
West Elmer Road, Vineland, NJ in the estimated amount of $11,000.00.

Motion-
Second- (Certification of Funds) 

CERT OF FUNDS-  GARRISON.PDF, RES EMERGENCY CONTRACT-  GARRISON ENT.PDF , EMERG PRCRMNTRPT -GARRISON ENT.PDF

Resolution Item (3) 

Resolution authorizing award of contract for purchase of a 2013 or Newer Jet Vac and Catch Basin Cleaner to Timmerman Co., Inc, 3554 Route 22 West, PO Box 71, Whitehouse, NJ  08888 in the amount of $299,000.00

Motion-
Second- (Certification of Funds) 

CERT OF FUNDS-  TIMMERMAN.PDF, RES - JET VAC TIMMERMAN.PDF

Resolution Item (4) 

Resolution authorizing Special Assessment of Municipal Liens for certain properties due to expenses incurred by the City of Millville relating to Board and Secure of Properties plus administration fees in accordance with Chapter 11, 
Article VI of the Municipal Code

Motion-
Second-

RES BOARD AND SECURE- 7- 5- 16.PDF

Resolution Item (5) 

Resolution authorizing a Memorandum of Agreement with TOWERCO 2013 LLC, a Delaware limited liability company to allow TOWERCO to perfect its rights to lease by recording it at the County Clerks office for the existing tower 
located at the Fire Department facility at 420 Buck Street

Motion-
Second-

RES TOWERCO 2013 LLC 6 27 16 (002).PDF , TOWERCO MOA.PDF

Resolution Item (6) 

Resolution authorizing Special Assessment of Municipal Liens for certain properties due to expenses incurred by the City of Millville relating to Cut and Clean plus administration fees in accordance with Chapter 11, Article VI of the 
Municipal code

Motion-
Second-

RES CUT AND CLEAN JULY 5 2016 MEETING.PDF

Resolution Item (7)

Resolution authorizing public auction of vehicles and equipment no longer needed for public use to be held on July 21, 2016 at 10:00 a.m., Police Impound Lot, Brandriff and Columbia Avenues

Motion-
Second-

RES PUBLIC AUCTION-  7- 21 - 16.PDF, PUBLIC AUCTION NOTICE -7 - 5- 16MTNG.PDF

Resolution Item (8)

Resolution authorizing adjustments to the tax and utility records
Motion-

Second-

RES TAX- UTILITY 2016- 07 - 05.PDF

Resolution Item (9) 

Resolution authorizing Second  Amendment to professional service contract approved by Resolution No. R257 -2015  on September 15, 2015 and First Amendment was approved by Resolution No. R115 -2016 on April 5, 
2016  with Todd J. Gelfand, Esquire of the firm of Barker, Gelfand and James, subsitute labor counsel for Gruccio, Pepper, DeSanto & Ruth, P.A., for an additional $5,000.00
Motion-

Second- (Certification of Funds) 

CET OF FUNDS GELFAND.PDF, RES BARKER, GELFAND AND JAMES, PC PSC.PDF, PSC BARKER GELFAND AND JAMES, PC (2).PDF

Resolution Item (10)

Resolution to approve the promotion of Steven Pierce to the position of Superintendent of Water Distribution, (provisional) Department of Public Works, with a starting salary of $76,000 effective July 1, 2016,  pursuant to Municipal 
Code 46- 12, subject to approval by the Civil Service Commission

Motion -
Second-

RES STEVEN PIERCE 7 -5 - 2016.PDF

Resolution Item (11)

Resolution authorizing Special Assessment of Municipal Liens for properties due to expenses incurred by the City of Millville relating to a demolition in accordance with Chapter 11 of the Municipal Code
Motion-

Second-

RES-  DEMO -  400 N 3RD ST.PDF

Resolution Item (12)

Resolution authorizing Water/Sewer Termination on July 18, 2016 due to payment default pursuant to Section 56 - 18 of the Municipal Code
Motion-
Second-

RES TURN OFF WATER AND SEWER 7 - 5- 16.PDF

Resolution Item (13) 

Resolution authorizing Agreement between the Millville Housing Authority and the City of Millville for enhanced police services at Holly Berry Court and the adjacent areas

Motion-
Second-

RES HOLLY BERRY COURT 6 15 16.PDF, AGREEMENT POLICE SERVICES HOLLY BERRY COURT 6 15 16.PDF

Resolution Item (14) 

Resolution authorizing First Amendment to Professional Service Contract adopted by Resolution No. R30 - 2016 on January 19, 2016 with Robert Verry, Hearing Officer for administrative proceedings involving disciplinary and grievance 
matters within the Millville Police Department for an additional $12,500.00.

Motion-
Second- (Certification of Funds) 

CERT OF FUNDS-  VERRY.PDF , RES ROBERT A VERRY 1ST AMENDED PSC 6 22 16.PDF , PSC ROBERT A VERRY 1ST AMENDED 6 22 16 (002).PDF

Resolution Item (15)

Resolution authorizing Second Amendment to Professional Service Contract  adopted by Resolution No. R16- 2016 on January 5, 2016 with Maley & Associates, Counsellors at Law, 931 Haddon Avenue, Collingswood, New Jersey 
08108- 2111, Special Counsel for Redevelopment for an additional $10,000.00.

Motion-
Second- (Certification of Funds) 

CERT OF FUNDS-  MALEY.PDF , RES PSC MALEY ASSOCS 6 22 16 .PDF , PSC 2ND AMENDED MALEY ASSOCS 6 22 16.PDF

Resolution Item (16) 

Resolution adopting a form required to be used for the filing of notices of Tort Claim against the City of Millville in accordance with the provisions of the New Jersey Tort Claims Act, N.J.S.A. 59:8- 6.

Motion-
Second-

RES ADOPT TORT FORM.PDF

Resolution Item (17) 

Resolution authorizing the City of Millville to execute a Subordination Agreement with Quicken Loans pertaining to 559 Columbia Avenue, Block 553, Lot 19, William Phillips
Motion-

Second-

RES -  559 COLUMBIA -  PHILLIPS SUBORDINATION 7 - 5- 16.PDF

Resolution Item (18) 

Resolution to approve Stipulation of Dismissal with prejudice as to Counts 2 through 5 re: City of Millville vs Richard Abbott, William Whitehead, Judith Whitehead, John Doe 1- 10, abc corp 1 - 10
Motion-
Second-

RES -  BOAT DOCKS-  ABBOTT.PDF , STIPULATION OF DISMISSAL - WHITEHEAD - ABBOTT DOCKS.PDF

Resolution Item (19) 

Resolution to approve the release of closed session minutes re: City of Millville vs Richard Abbott, William Whitehead, Judith Whitehead, John Doe 1- 10, abc corp 1 -10

Motion-
Second-

RES - OPEN CLOSED SESSION MINUTES - DOCKS.PDF, EXHIBIT A - CLOSED SESSION RELEASE SCHEDULE.PDF

Resolution Item (20)

Resolution to approve the promotion of Frank Hignutt to the position of Sewage Plant Superintendent/Sewer Superintendent (Provisional), Department of Public Works, with a starting salary of $84,622.82 effective July 1, 2016, 
 pursuant to Municipal Code 46- 12, subject to approval by the Civil Service Commission

Motion-
Second-

RES FRANK HIGNUTT 7 - 5- 2016.PDF

NEW BUSINESS

New Business Item (1)

Motion authorizing the City Clerk/Administrator to advertise for the following bid proposals to be received on the specified date and time by the City of Millville Purchasing Board, Richard C. McCarthy Commission Chamber, City Hall:
a) 15th Street Fencing and Gates to be received on June 28, 2016, 10:00 A.M.
b) Lease of Space for Temporary Cellular Antenna System to be received on June 28, 2016, 10:00 A.M.
c ) Wastewater Treatment Plant Phase II Upgrades Project to be received on August 23, 2016, 10:00 A.M.

Motion-
Second-

PN-  15TH STREET FENCING AND GATES.PDF , PN LEASE SPACE FOR CELLULAR ANTENNAS 2016.PDF, PN WWTP.PDF

New Business Item (2)

Motion authorizing the following Special Event on Public Lands Applications:

a) 5k Run/1 Mile Walk sponsored by the Millville PBA Local No. 213 to be held on Saturday, July 16, 2016, 8:00 a.m. to 1:00 p.m., Chiola Field, (Ware Avenue, W. Main Street and Brandriff Avenue)
b) Community Event with Child Activities sponsored by Gateway Community Action Partnership to be held on August 6, 2016, 12:30 p.m. to 5:30 p.m. at Waltman Park

c ) Downtown Car Show Annual Event sponsored by Greater Millville Chamber of Commerce to be held on August 13, 2016 (Rain Date: August 20, 2016), 6:30 a.m. to 4:00 p.m. on High Street from Main Street to Broad Street
Motion-

Second-

PUBLIC COMMENT PORTION

"We have now reached the public comment portion of our meeting.  Anyone who would like to address the Commission, please go to the podium, state your name and address your concerns.  Please limit your comments to 
approximately 5 minutes."

Open Public Portion

Close Public Portion

Comments by Commissioners

Adjourn 

1.

2.

3.

4.

4.I.

Documents:

5.

5.I.

Documents:

6.

7.

8.

9.

9.I.

Documents:

10.

11.

12.

12.I.

Documents:

13.

13.I.

Documents:

14.

14.I.

Documents:

14.II.

Documents:

14.III.

Documents:

14.IV.

Documents:

14.V.

Documents:

14.VI.

Documents:

14.VII.

Documents:

14.VIII.

Documents:

14.IX.

Documents:

14.X.

Documents:

14.XI.

Documents:

14.XII.

Documents:

14.XIII.

Documents:

14.XIV.

Documents:

14.XV.

Documents:

14.XVI.

Documents:

14.XVII.

Documents:

14.XVIII.

Documents:

14.XIX.

Documents:

14.XX.

Documents:

15.

15.I.

Documents:

15.II.

16.

http://www.millvillenj.gov/5d6d1ce0-30d3-4a35-b69e-cf1957008761

